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Abstract  
 
This article displays a reconsideration of literary data that leads to the suggestion that the process of the 
face identification and of the recognition of human facial expressions, in addition to the perception of 
single facial features and their configurations, is based on the more essential creation of the 
polysemantic interpersonal relationships. In schizophrenic patients this ability is lost. The feeling of the 
human nature of faces is out of the competence of these patients and faces cause emotional tension with 
the subsequent use of the psychological defense. 
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1. FACIAL IDENTIFICATION IN HEALTHY SUBJECTS 
 
This article is not a comprehensive review of the scientific publications related to the title. 
This article is a scientific essay that is going to discuss some questions and contradictions and 
to propose some speculative suggestions just with a hope that these speculations will be used 
for further investigations. I am going to discuss the psychological and brain mechanisms of 
face and facial expressions perception and recognition in healthy subjects and in 
schizophrenic patients. However, I hope to put this problem in a broad frame of human 
interrelationships. 

In some investigations the process of face identification is considered to be a detection of 
some peculiar features of the face, like the shape and the size of nose, eyes, lips etc. (Joshua & 
Rosell, 2009). This way of face identification, being based on the splitting of the face on its 
separate elements, is proposed as a natural. Probably it really may be relevant in those 
relatively rare cases when some particular facial features look out as so outstanding that can 
be used by itself for the recognition of the person. For instance, according to some 
contemporaries, the Russian famous producer Vsevolod Meyerchold had exactly such a nose: 
on one caricature his nose was looking out of the corner of the house and the inscription 
under the drawing was: Five minutes before the appearance of Meyerchold”.  

However, with exception of such exotic cases, human face is perceived as a holistic image, as a 
gestalt (Calder & Jansen 2005). That’s why, beyond stressing the importance of single features in 
face identification, scientists estimate the leading role of the general configuration of the face 
in this process, and they select figures of this configuration that are available for the 
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algorhythmic analysis (Joshua & Rosell, 2005). The basic configuration of the first order 
reflects the natural distribution of interrelationships between facial features: eyes are above 
the nose, nose is above the mouth. The configuration of the second order includes the space 
between particular facial features that are different in different persons: a distance between 
eyes, between nose and mouth, between eye brows and head hair, etc.  

The articles on this topic make an impression that the recognition of faces is achieved on 
the basis of a very speed calculation and estimation of all these parameters, and only these 
configurations in combination with the single particular features are responsible for the 
distinguishing one face from another. Thus, the process of face identification can be 
computerized. However, it means that according to these parameters (items, figures) human 
face does not differ essentially from any object of the world (may be except of the basic 
configuration of the first order that is specific for the face). This basic configuration cannot be 
inverted because if eyes are under the nose it is not a face more. If the picture of the face is 
inverted and the forehead is localized downstairs and the chin – upstairs, healthy subjects 
usually have difficulties in face recognition, while the inversion of other objects, even very 
complicated according to their configuration, does not disturb the process of recognition 
(Yin, 1969). Thus, the basic configuration allows to discriminate any face from any object. 
However, it does not determine the recognition of any concrete face because according to 
these variables all faces are similar. 

According to the configuration of the second order, that was suggested to be responsible 
for the recognition of the particular human face, human faces seem not to differ from objects. 
Probably it is another domain in the face that is closely related to the unique quality of 
personality, and is responsible for face recognition, but was not grasped by the investigators? 
Is a picture of the face drawn according to the formal rules (algorhythms) really similar to the 
picture drawn by an artist or at least similar to the photo of the vivid face? All these aspects 
of the problem are not discussed. 
 
 
2. THE RECOGNITION OF EMOTIONAL FACIAL EXPRESSIONS IN HEALTHY SUBJECTS 
 
Up to this point we have considered the recognition of faces with neutral expressions. 
However, people are recognizing not only different faces – the own face,  faces of famous 
persons, familiar faces, unfamiliar faces of those persons they have met previously for 
occasion or those they are motivated to remember in the process of investigation. People are 
able to recognize also facial expressions of different emotions. Personal identity is invariant, 
while emotional expressions are different in the same subject. It was suggested that different 
brain systems are responsible for the recognition of the identity of the subject and for the 
estimation of his/her emotional expression (Haxby et al., 2000). In most of the investigations, 
scientists have checked the recognition of the very definite, doubtless emotional expressions, 
like oppositions between happiness and grief, happiness and fear, pleasure and anger etc. In 
some publications (Tsoi et al., 2008; Norton et al., 2009; Alimova et al., 2009) it was shown, 
that healthy people recognize positive emotional expressions (joy, pleasure, happiness) more 
easy than the expressions of surprise or of negative emotions (anger, fear, disgust, grief). The 
expression of happiness is recognized more easy, with a shorten delay, than the expression of 
surprise, expression of surprise – more easy than expression of anger, expression of anger – 
more easy than expression of fear, fear more easy than grief,  and grief is recognized more 
easy than disgust (Adolphs, 2002). However, some emotional expressions are often mixed 
with other – for instance, fear can be accepted as a surprise (Adolphs, 2002). The schedule for 
the recognition of happiness is lower than the schedule for the recognition of fear (Norton et 
al., 2009). 

The difference in the recognition of different emotional expressions may be caused by two 
reasons. On the one hand, some emotional expressions, like happiness, may be more simple 
for recognition being based on some definite monosemantic features like lips that are 
stretched in a smile and are interpreted as a sign of positive emotions. 
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However some recent investigations (Niedenthal et al., 2010) confirmed what all of us 
new from our own personal experience: a smile can reflect not only a state of joy and 
happiness, it may be a smile of superiority, a sign of politeness or an expression of irony. In 
the abovementioned investigations where positive facial expressions were compared with the 
negative one, smile was always used as an expression of happiness and joy – according to the 
conditions of these investigations.  In the real communications healthy people are able to 
recognize all shades and meanings of smile, however it would be reasonable to check 
whether the smile of superiority is recognized as easy as smile of happiness and whether the 
recognition of superiority (that displays itself in smile) is also more easy than the recognition 
of fear and anger. And if the significant difference is only between the recognition of the true 
happiness and negative emotions, it would mean that it is not the formal shape of lips (smile) 
that determines the prevalent recognition of positive emotions. It would mean that it is 
another mechanism. It can be a psychological defense mechanism (denial or repression) that 
protect subject from the perception of negative face expression but has no reason to protect 
subject from positive face expressions. Some authors (Norton et al., 2009; Huang et al., 2009) 
suggest this mechanism to explain the more high schedule for recognizing negative 
emotional expressions in schizophrenia (see later) but the similar mechanism may act in 
healthy sensitive subjects. Anger of another person may cause fear; melancholy or disgust 
may be passed to the person who percepts these expressions and a person may try to protect 
himself from such emotions. Quite opposite, a person would be glad to share with another 
person a feeling of joy and it makes the schedule for this expression more low. 

Bar et al. (2006a) have shown that people prefer soft and circular visual objects vs. sharp 
and full of corners that arose a feeling of danger. The same is with the face images – their 
circular and soft shape provokes sympathy and tenderness and became a trigger of positive 
emotions. Niedenthal et al. (2010) suggest that those who are viewing a smile of happiness 
are creating in their mind an “embodied reproduction” of the positive affective state 
transferred by the smile, and due to this reproduction of affect understand the meaning of a 
smile of smiling person. This “embodied reproduction” from my point of view reflects the 
emotional contact based on polysemantic relationships with the smiling person. Niedenthal 
et al.  suggest (and this suggestion is very reasonable) that the analysis of the features of the 
face may be sufficient for the estimation of the conventional and standard face expressions in 
simple tasks (when smiling lips reflect joy and frown brow reflect anger). However, such 
formal analysis does not help to recognize vivid expressions that contain all shades of 
feelings, as well as for the representation their fine and ambiguous nuances. For such tasks it 
is not enough to get a direct visual perception of the particular features of the face and their 
configuration. It is necessary to build a more broad context that includes these features of the 
face but has something in addition. For instance, this context has to include some knowledge 
about a person who express emotions, or to guess about it on the basis of previous 
experience, for the relevant interpretation of the ambiguous face expression. This expression 
became “embodied” in the motor, somatosensoric and emotional systems of the observer. 
Affect that is caused by another person, is projected on this person.   

Human face is different from all other objects because it includes the imprinting of the 
unrestricted  rich personality of the subject that is in complicated and polydimensional 
relationships with the polydimensional and polysemantic world (Rotenberg, 2007). Due to 
these polysemantic relationships the holistic perception of the face, as well as the perception 
of the vivid personality as being an owner of this face, cannot be reduced to  the perception 
of the particular features of this face, their combinations and configurations. Such a holistic 
perception means to overcome the restrictions of these features and configurations and to 
include an unlimited spectrum of relations between subject and the world. Just due to the 
perception of the face in this broad context, the observer is able to conclude, while looking on 
the neutral face expression without definite signs of anger, fear, disgust or joy, whether the 
owner of this face is dangerous or not, is he/she pleasant or not, - and it is difficult for 
observer to explain the reasons of this implicit and integrative conclusion. 
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Bar et al. (2006b) have shown that the first and most important impressions evoked by 
personality appear very soon, in 39 msec., on the early stage of the face perception. During 
this very short period the estimation of the threat caused by the face with emotionally neutral 
expression was related to the personality of this unfamiliar person per se, not to his/her 
temporary emotional state. This personality is estimated, for instance, as dangerous in 
general, does not matter whether it was threatening for the observer in this particular 
moment, because the estimation was performed not in the process of the direct contact with 
this person but only by viewing his/her grey – even not coloured !- photography with a 
neutral expression. Authors emphasized that the features of the face that caused threatening 
vs. non-threatening impression are grasped very quickly because this impression has a vital 
meaning (sense) and is important for the security of the observer. I suggest that such 
impression is determined not by particular features of the face (at least in most cases when 
they are not particularly distorted) but by the broad spectrum of past associations based on 
the previous experience. Ghuman and Bar (2006) have emphasized in their investigation the 
role of these associations in the estimation of visual objects, and it seems to be especially 
important for the estimation of the face. It reflects the integration of the human face into the 
net of polydimensional relationships. If, for instance, we are coming back to the problem of 
the perception of the smile, there are no formal criterions for its truthful sense – whether it is 
accepted as a truthful or false is determined by the contextual relations and associations. Due 
to these relationships a smile, a face impression and a body posture contain something more 
than what can be analyzed according to the formal criterions. Probably as I have mentioned, 
for the formation of the relevant contextually determined associations is necessary to rely on 
the previous experience of interpersonal relationships. But presumably there may be also 
some inherent predispositions to this ability: an infant is searching for the contact with the 
empathic person and is crying while watching even a neutral expression of the face of the 
emotionally blunt person. It means that even an infant is able to grasp the subject’s ability to 
build emotional relationships due to the functional domination of the right hemisphere, its 
temporal lobe (Saugstad, 1998). With the warm mother such relationships start almost 
immediately after birth. However, in the process of maturation this ability may develop or 
decrease probably according to the domination of the right-hemispheric or left-hemispheric 
mentality (what also partly depends on the character of relationships with the surrounding 
social environment). It is important to realize that the smile (as well as any other facial 
expression) is not simply “embodied” in the observer, but between two persons appear new 
polysemantic interrelationships. 

The smile of the own and of the strange (somebody else’s) child both are usually causing 
positive emotional reaction, however they cause different reactions in the fronto-orbital 
cortex of the adult (see Niedenthal et al., 2010). It confirms the conclusion that it is not a 
simple reaction on the smile per se, but on the smile that is integrated in the relationships 
with the subject’s own child. The same happens between adults. A subject perceives and 
estimates a face of another subject after he has seen during his life numerous different faces 
and they have made different impressions. Emotional tension that the sensible person often 
suffers from in the crowd may be also a reaction on this stream of associations.  With some 
persons have been previously created emotional relationships, and the facial expressions of 
some strangers may resemble such emotional relationships even vague. 

Mimicry is a visible or un-visible use of subject’s own mimic muscles of observer in order 
to compare it implicitly with a facial gesture of observed person (see Niedenthal et al., 2010). 
It is possible to suggest that implicit imitation of the someone’s facial expression helps subject 
to understand the sense of this expression not only because the reproduction of the mimic 
reaction activates brain zones that are responsible for the relevant experience. When subject is 
reacting on the face expression of another subject he/she is not only activating his/her limbic 
system through the own facial muscles – he/she is creating (unconsciously) new 
relationships with another person. Would the outcome be the same if subject will try to 
imitate the someone’s facial expression using his own mimic muscles without the direct 
visual contact , only according to verbal instruction?...It seems very doubtful. 
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The mimicry of the facial expression may be important because it is a sign for the observer 
that he/she started an emotional contact. When the facial mimicry is blocked, emotions 
became less prominent.           

In this context it is interesting that the organic paralysis of the mimic muscles of observer 
do not prevent the recognition of emotional expression of the observed person, while the 
pencil in the mouth that also blocks the mimic imitation disturbs the recognition of emotional 
expression (see Niedenthal et al., 2010). It means that the problem is not the blockade of facial 
muscles per se;  the artificial situation caused by the pencil in the mouth shifts the attention 
of the observer and makes his/her interrelationships with the observed person unnatural 
while the stable paralysis of facial muscles causes finally the psychological adaptation to this 
condition. Thus the mimicry of facial expression participates in the interpersonal 
relationships. 

The active participation in emotional polysemantic relationships is from my point of view 
more important for the recognition of emotions than the feedback between mimic muscles 
and brain zones of emotional reactions. I suppose that if person will simply learn some mimic 
reactions it will not cause emotional experience that is relevant to these reactions in the 
natural conditions.  

At the same time, in the process of recognition of the typical standard facial expressions 
mimicry may be less important because such recognition includes conceptual knowledge 
instead of the vivid interrelationships. However, mimicry may be not very important also 
when the polysemantic interrelationships between observer and observed subject are 
available without it.   

When the observer gets an instruction to lower voluntary the corners of the mouth it does 
not block the recognition of the observed facial expression. This result of the experimental 
investigations (see Niedenthal et al., 2010) needs explanation. One such speculative 
explanation is that to lower the corner of the mouth is a formal and easy voluntary gesture 
that  does not allow to imitate smile but it does not block the concentration on this smile and 
the feeling of empathy and of course does not prevent the conceptual approach to the smile. 

At the same time, a spontaneous imitation of the facial expression is a sign of empathy 
that is an important part of interpersonal relationships (see  Niedenthal et al., 2010). Is 
empathy obligate for feeling another person?  Autistic subjects who are not imitating facial 
expressions of other people but in general are functioning well are able to recognize facial 
expression, as well as healthy subjects do (see Niedenthal et al., 2010). These data require  a 
careful analysis. Probably in experiments with autistic subjects the task (facial expression) 
was simple and standard? If it was the case, autistic subjects were oriented on formal 
concepts of facial expressions, not on the creation of emotional relationships, because in the 
every-day life they are not very sensitive to emotional variables. 

The posture and gestures that are not directly   expressed in mimic are also important for 
the recognition of the smile. They are also based on the right hemispheric mechanisms 
responsible for the polysemantic interpersonal relationships. Especially important is the eyes 
contact. Persons are more able to imitate the expression of pain when they are in a state of 
eyes contact and angry faces cause more negative affect in observer when the eye contact is 
present. The expression of human eyes is inexhaustible. However, those who percept the 
smile of pleasure can smile back without  eye contact with the observed smiling person, 
simply due to positive emotion caused by the smile per se. Such a reaction – smile towards 
the smile of somebody – is the reaction on the joy of another person, even without the direct 
contact with this person. When the smile reflects only the joy initiated by the joy of another 
person, this smile does not differ from the smile on any positive information and does not 
reflect the interpersonal contact. Such smile also may not be accompanied by the eye contact. 
However, in general eye contact is an important sign of humanness that includes the 
polysemantic relationships between people. 

A three-day old child is viewing faces with a gaze that is directed on him for a more long 
period than faces with a gaze turned away from him (see Niedenthal et al., 2010).  However, 
is it the same eye contact as in adults?...An infant is grasping an integrated holistic face 
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expression in order to understand (on the unconscious level) whether it is dangerous or not, 
comfortable or not to be in contact with this person. It is a monosemantic impression, and the 
reaction of the infant on this holistic message is also monosemantic. For the polysemantic 
emotional contact the infant still has no skills. Autistic children avoid direct eyes contact in 
the process of recognition of emotional facial expression however they are often able to 
recognize these expressions correctly probably due to orientation on other parts of the face  
(see Niedenthal et al., 2010). A normal adult subject may avoid eyes contact if he/she is 
afraid of emotional interrelationships and do not feel himself confident in such relationships. 
However, this subject is able to recognize correctly a relatively simple face expression. 
Inability to have a direct eyes contact may increase attention to the lips region and due to this 
attention subject is able to discriminate the expression of joy from the expression of fear or 
disgust. 

Eyes contact is working as a trigger for the embodied simulation that prescribes to the 
smile different and vague functional meanings (see Niedenthal et al., 2010). Exactly the eyes 
contact is leading to the embodied simulation  because eyes contain a rich world of 
experiences that do not have formal expression. Eyes contact and embodied simulation 
(imitation) may become repressed if they seems to be too risky or even aversive. When the 
eyes contact is absent or when embodied simulation that reflects the polysemantic contact 
between people is suppressed by social factors, the estimation of the sense of the smile 
(whether it is true or false) is determined by monosemantic stereotypes that have social roots. 
People often use such stereotypes and concepts that are creating a probability forecast   
according to the meaning of the smile. Due to such concepts people are able to translate an 
experience elicited by the direct perception into the amodal language. (Niedental et al., 2010). 
Polymodal perception is not equal to its conceptual presentation. Different systems are 
responsible for them. 

According to my theory (Rotenberg, 1979, 1985, 1994, 2004, 2007, 2008) the difference 
between systems is related to the difference between the right hemispheric way of thinking 
that creates the polysemantic context and left hemispheric way of thinking that is responsible 
for the formation of the monosemantic context. Of course the concept may influence the 
perception by activating a previous experience however a new direct impression may be 
more strong… 

From my point of view, emotions may be created by the concepts, however if they are not 
supported by the direct actual experience or at least by the previous  experience of vivid 
feelings they are not complete and sufficient. Of course initial concept may influence the 
direct perception ( the perception of the smile) but this concept has to be based on the 
relevant past experience that forms the vivid image what the smile has to express and how it 
has to look out.  For the real embodied simulation it is necessary to overcome restrictions of 
the monosemantic context (if this context is not triggering the vivid past experience, but in 
this condition it is not a pure concept). Does it not mean that the pure concept may become a 
trigger that activates mechanisms that are abolishing this concept?... 

In one investigation (see Niedenthal et al., 2010) subjects have watched natural real smiles 
and they were informed   that these smiles appear either in the context that makes natural 
smiles predictable , according to the cultural stereotypes, or that these smiles appear in the 
context that predispose to the false smiles. In half of investigated subjects the facial imitation 
of the watched smiles was artificially blocked. All subjects had to estimate the degree of the 
sincerity of the watched smile.  

When the imitation of the smile was available, the information of the cultural stereotypes 
was not influencing the perception of the sincerity of the smile probably because the 
imitation helped to create interpersonal relationships and empathy that overcome the 
restriction of the concept. When the imitation was not available, a smile that appeared in the 
context associated with a natural smile was accepted as a more natural than smile that 
appeared in the context that made false smiles principally available. However, actually all 
smiles were natural but when the imitation is blocked a context and a concept are influencing 
the perception. It means that imitation makes the direct emotional interrelationships more 
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available and more effective. (When I speak about emotional interrelationships it does not 
mean of course that the observed subject especially being on the picture is really participating 
in these relationships. However it does not prevent the feeling of the observer that he is in 
emotional relationship with the observed subject, like it happened when we see on the street 
a happy unfamiliar subject and feel that we share for a moment a happiness with him or 
when we feel close relationships with a person on the picture of a great artist.) The embodied 
simulation that Niedenthal et al. are speaking about is an empathic resonance and it is critical 
for the estimation of facial expression. The reaction on the smile with subject’s own smile is a 
personal participation in collaboration. It is something more broad and essential than the 
estimation of the emotional state of another person. It makes a person no strange, no more 
alien. It is related to the personality of the observer.   And the identification of faces – not 
only of the facial expressions – presumably includes the same mechanism because every face 
if it is vivid produces an aura of polysemantic contextual associations. 

In order to be perceived, emotional expression of the face has to make a holistic 
impression on the observer. A composition from the joyful and angry expression of the same 
face ( when eyes express an anger and lips express a joy) makes the recognition of such 
combined expression difficult and takes more time even if observer is required to concentrate 
attention consequently on every half of this combined photo. It is difficult for the observer to 
ignore the impression caused by the holistic gestalt of the face, as well as it is difficult to 
recognize a person on the photo combined from the parts of faces of two different persons 
with neutral faces expressions. (Calder et al., 2000; Young et al, 1987). At the same time, this 
disturbing effect of composition is absent, if the photo is combined from the pictures of two 
different persons with the similar emotional expressions and observer has to recognize only 
the emotional expression (Calder et al., 2000).  In such case the combination of the upper part 
of the face picture of one person with the lower part of the face picture of another person 
does not disturb the recognition of the facial expression. Moreover, even the face by itself is 
in this case estimated as belonging to one person. It means that emotional expression is a 
determinative factor probably because the emotional expression is relatively more simple 
and definite than something that determines the recognition of personality, especially if this 
person is unfamiliar for the observer and is not famous (it means not well-known in the 
society) . Another reason of such domination of emotional expression may be the importance 
of the emotional expression in human’s interrelationships. However, it is necessary to take 
into consideration that emotional expressions used in such investigations are in most cases 
based on a very definite and standard, almost monosemantic mimic expressions (like broad 
smile of lips- smile of joy). 

The mechanisms of the recognition of simple emotional expressions that can be 
conceptualized and mechanisms of face recognition are different. (Calder & Young, 2005; 
Haxby et al., 2000; Schwartz, 2002; Pomarol-Clotet et al., 2009). That’s why during the 
recognition  of emotions the difference between two parts of the face picture  that belong to 
different persons is ignored if emotional expressions of these two parts are similar, and these 
two parts are not estimated as belonging to different subjects. At the same time, when it is 
necessary to recognize a person and two different emotional expressions of the same person 
are combined, the recognition is available, because the signs of personality in this task are 
more important. Actually, we are able to recognize the same subject with different emotional 
expressions probably until the emotional experiences caused by his life are not changing the 
personality by itself. The role of the complicated but unified image is probably less important 
in the recognition of emotions (especially of relatively simple emotional expressions) than in 
the recognition of personality.   

However, both mechanisms are probably not totally separated (see Calder & Young, 
2005). The recognition of the complicated emotions requires right-hemispheric mechanisms 
that are responsible for accepting the polysemantic context and are also used in the process of 
face recognition. On the other hand, during a face recognition, as I have mentioned, appears 
a thin connection between the past experience of observer, including his/her emotional 
associations, and the image of the person who is an object of observation. Actually it is 
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something more than the recognition – it is an inclusion of the image of observed person into 
the broad mental world of the observer. Human face contains something for another subject 
that makes this face very special, and it is impossible to reduce this particular meaning to the 
list of separate features and even to their configurations. Face is perceived as a meaningful 
gestalt and authors emphasize (Calder & Jansen, 2005 ) that the holistic recognition of the 
face as well as of the natural, not conceptualized, emotional expression are not explained by 
the configurations of the second type (see above). Face is not an object. 

The reaction of the brain on the holistic image of the face (global processing) forestalls its 
reaction on details of this image (Obayashi et al., 2009).  The integrative perception of the 
image is performed by the right hemisphere more speed than the analysis of its parts 
(Kostandov & Genkina, 1976). However, the mystery of this holistic perception of the face is 
that it is determined by something what is beyond this image per se, by something that 
integrates it in the broad context of the inner world of observer. I have already emphasized 
that even a fluent view on the face of the unfamiliar subject with a neutral face expression 
may elicit in observer a feeling of empathy or an opposite feeling, and it is an outcome of the 
holistic impression that creates the image of the face not as an image of a separate object but 
as a vivid image that is already in some mysterious relationships with the observer. 

In this context it is interesting to mention that in dogs experts who are training dogs the 
effect of inversion of the muzzle of the dog is similar to the effect of the inversion of the 
human face (see Schwartz et al., 2002). It does not happened in non-experts in dogs. It is 
possible to speculate that these specialists create personal relationships with their dogs that 
are absent in other persons. 
 
 
3. THE ROLE OF THE SOCIAL STEREOTYPES 
 
Simons and Levin (1998) have shown that the perception and recognition of another subject 
depends on whether the observer consider the observed subject to belong to his own social 
group. In their investigation an experimenter initiated a conversation with a pedestrian and 
during the interaction he (investigator) was surreptitiously replaced by another 
experimenter. When the experimenters appeared to be members of an out-group the ability 
to detect a change to the centrally attended object in a scene was dramatically reduced. The 
experimenters imitated construction workers, and a pedestrian (a student) categorized them 
as construction workers. By this formal categorization subject did not retain those personal 
features that would allow individuation. No personal relationships were created with this 
occasional “construction worker”. Subjects appeared focused on the interaction and 
conversation, often making even eye contact with the experimenters, listening to their voices, 
and all these interrelations did not help subject to discover the replace of the experimenter by 
another one, because the conversation does not include the personal contact – subject 
contacted with a concept of “construction worker’. The observer (pedestrian) was not 
considering the experimenter to belong to his own virtual world. It means that when subject 
considers another person with whom he is communicating not to belong to his representative 
group (according to the age, social position, nation etc.) he often perceives this person 
differently, not like an individual person but like a representative of a concept, and may be 
not able to recognize him.¨ 
 
   
4. THE RECOGNITION OF THE OWN FACE   

  
A very important part of the problem is the recognition of the subject’s own face and its 
difference from the recognition of familiar faces of other persons. According to Keenan et al. 
(1999) if a person sends a signal with his right hand that he recognized on the photo himself 
vs. another but familiar person, these two reactions do not differ according to the delay. It 
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means that for the left hemisphere being responsible for the decision in this condition the 
subject’s own face and the face of the familiar person are equal. 

However, when the same subjects reacted with their left hands (and the right hemisphere 
was responsible for the decision and action) the identification of the familiar faces was 
performed with a greater delay in comparison to the own face identification. Authors 
conclude that self-recognition is performed by the right hemisphere. From my point of view 
it does not mean that the right hemisphere is not participating in the recognition of familiar 
faces, but probably for this task the role of the left hemisphere is also important. At the same 
time Self-Image localized in the right hemisphere (Rotenberg, 1982) is presumably 
responsible for the recognition of the subject’s own face. Self-Image integrates numerous 
connections between the person and the world that includes objects, events, social 
interrelationships, virtual world of culture, and due to all these connections and 
interrelationships integrates also the past and the present of the subject. And the left 
hemisphere is responsible for the Self-Concept that principally does not differ from any other 
concept, including concepts of the familiar and famous persons. The role of the Self-Image 
and Self-Concept in the process of self-recognition is different but both are participating in 
this process. Platek et al. (2008) have shown that although the right hemisphere dominates in 
the process of the self-face perception, some definite structures of the left hemisphere are also 
activated, particularly left fusiform gyrus. 

Turk et al. (2002) investigated the patient with a split brain after cutting corpus callosum.  
Authors presented to his right and left hemisphere consequently his own face and faces  of 
familiar persons. All these presented faces have been partly artificially distorted and the 
degree of such distortion was different: some pictures were very similar to the initial natural 
picture (image) but other were quite different.  The percentage of the correct recognitions was 
of course higher when pictures were relatively more similar to the not distorted model, does 
not matter whether it was subject’s own face or familiar face and the left or the right 
hemisphere was involved. Authors come to the conclusion that both hemispheres are able to 
recognize own and familiar faces. Moreover, recognition of the partly distorted own face was 
even more successful if it was presented to the left hemisphere. It seems to be in 
contradiction with the abovementioned data and data of other authors (Sugiura et al., 2005; 
Platek et al., 2004) that have shown the advantage of the right hemisphere in the process of 
own face recognition. However, it is possible to suggest that distortion of the face image 
disturbed the holistic nature of the image and this nature is obligate for the successful face 
recognition by the right hemisphere. As a result the advantage is on the side of the left 
hemisphere that is performing a consequential detailed analysis of the picture and compares 
the outcome of this analysis with the initial monosemantic concept. The attention to 
particular features, the ability to distinguish some details from the whole picture and to 
ignore them may explain the role of the left hemisphere in this task. Platek et al. (2004) belief 
that in this condition the task of the own face recognition as a holistic image is displaced by 
the task on the working memory. As soon as the opportunity to grasp the holistic image 
appears, the advantage turns back to the right hemisphere. 

When in the presented face image the features of the own face have been artificially mixed 
with features of the face of well-known famous figures (Keenan et al., 2001) and the right 
hemisphere was suppressed for a short period, the observer took this image as a face of a 
famous person. When the left hemisphere was suppressed the observer recognized this 
mixed image as his own face – the general impression was more important than the single 
features. Presumably it is an additional sign of the role of the right-hemispheric Self-Image in 
self recognition. The middle frontal gyri  of the right hemisphere plays an important role in 
the perception of the subject’s own face and at the same time – in the empathic 
understanding of other subjects and in the perception of himself in the context of 
relationships with other people (Platek et al., 2008). When the image of the subject’s own face 
is presented to the right hemisphere of the patient with a split brain, his galvanic skin 
resistance (GSR) became more prominent in comparison  to the reaction on images of other 
faces or to the reaction on image of the own face presented to the left hemisphere (Preilowski, 
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1977). Even words that characterize subject are activating the right frontal lobe (Craik et al., 
1999). 

 The identification of the face and the recognition of its emotional expression have some 
common roots: it is a polysemantic context of relationships not only between particular 
features of the face, but also between this face and the world, including the inner world of the 
observed subject and of observer. It makes a difference between the identification of the 
human face and the identification of the inanimate objects – the former is an identification of 
the dynamic essence, not a harden essence. Just due to this dynamic vivid essence a person 
can become not recognizable although the configuration of his/her face does not change. 
And at the same time the person can be recognizable nevertheless of very different emotional 
expressions on the face if person is the same according to his essence. Thus when subject 
suddenly became unrecognizable his/her relatives intuitively feel that he/she changed as a 
person, it means the all his/her relationships with the world and other persons changed. 

This theoretical approach is supported also by the data of the investigations that have 
shown that prescribing to another subject a definite psychic state and the understanding of 
the mental state of another subject is determined by the activity of the same zones of the right 
hemisphere (the middle and the upper frontal gyrus) that are responsible for the recognition 
of the own face (Platek et al., 2004).  According to Gallap (1982), in order to recognize the 
own face in the mirror it is necessary to build a Self-Concept . 

The formation of the Self-Concept and Self-Image has the following dynamic. In the early 
childhood a man has a simple holistic image of the world and of himself, and it corresponds 
to the initial domination of the right hemisphere. This simple sensation of himself as a being 
that may have pleasant and unpleasant feelings have an infant and a monkey. However it is 
neither Self-Concept nor Self-Image.  Self-Concept appears in parallel with the development 
of the logical way of thinking, and in parallel develops the self-separation from the world 
and even the opposition to the world, and relationships with the world became restricted and 
impoverished. Consequently appears a need in the secondary integration in the world, 
already in a new position of being an independent subject. It is a need in creation of the new 
polysemantic relationships with the world that overcome this position of separation and 
opposition to the world. This task is achieved due to the development of the frontal lobe of 
the right hemisphere that is the latest brain zone to be matured and is the basic structure of 
the highest mental functions (Rotenberg, 2004, 2007). 

The damage of the right hemisphere, more often than the damage of the left hemisphere, 
causes the inability to interpret the mental state of another person and to understand jokes 
that contain heroes (Happe et al., 1999). It means that the virtual relationships with heroes are 
disturbed. It is difficult to such patients to imagine the ideas of others that are opposite to the 
well known “final truth”.  The empathy and the ability to understand the psychic state of 
another person (Theory of Mind) are related to the feeling of being integrated in the 
polydimensional complicated world where another person is integrated in also – a logical 
concept for such feeling is not enough. The damage of the left hemisphere does not disturb 
this empathy feeling of another person (Happe et al., 1999). 

Of course, the understanding of another person may be based on the logical analysis also, 
and these two ways of understanding can complete each other. However, inability to imagine 
the perception of the other person on the basis of subject’s own experience (Stuss et al., 2001) 
is first of all the inability to identify himself with this person and not a deficiency of analytical 
skills. Although the right hemisphere is responsible for both the perception of the visual-
spatial information and for the integration in the world, these two functions are different and 
are performed by different structures of the right hemisphere. For instance, in autism the 
visual spatial perception is not disturbed while skills of the global perception of the gestalt 
are absent.     
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5. FACE AND FACE EXPRESSION IDENTIFICATION IN SCHIZOPHRENIC PATIENTS 
 
Schizophrenic patients have problems with face identification and make more mistakes in 
this domain than healthy subjects. In one investigation (Shin et al., 2008) subjects had to 
discriminate faces presented on photo. Faces have been presented in normal and inverted 
positions. Subject had to estimate whether two faces presented in parallel ( at the same time ) 
are identical. Authors come to the conclusion that in comparison to healthy subjects patients 
are less able to recognize the configuration of faces while particular facial features were 
perceived normally.  

However, not all investigators agree with this conclusion. Schwartz et al. (2002), have 
shown that in healthy subjects and in schizophrenic patients the alteration of the 
configuration of the face is similarly influencing the process of face recognition, and 
suggested that schizophrenic patients are also using the configuration of the face for its 
recognition. 

In healthy subjects the inversion of the face changes the perception of the basic 
configuration of the face as a holistic gestalt but not the perception of single features. In 
schizophrenic patients face inversion paradoxically disturbs face perception much less – 
probably because in patients the perception of the face configuration is disturbed even in the 
face normal position, before inversion.  In healthy subjects but not in schizophrenic patients 
the inversion of the face disturbs the perception more than the inversion of the object. 
Inverted faces are recognized on the basis of their particular features, and attention to these 
features restricts the perception of the face as a holistic gestalt. The inversion disturbs the 
integrated vivid impression made by the face because the face cannot be inverted – with the 
inverted face the observer is unable to create direct personal relationships, the inverted face is 
not accepted as a face of a subject.  And if patients perceive faces similarly in a normal and in 
the inverted position probably it means that a “human” quality of the face is senseless for 
them. 

It may be also the reason why schizophrenic patients perceive irregular transfigured faces 
as less strange in comparison to healthy subjects (Bleich-Cohen et al., 2009). If patients are not 
sensitive enough to such peculiarities of the normal, regular images of faces as its vividness, 
than the lack of the sensitivity to its transfiguration is not surprising. It is interesting that the 
fusiform gyrus reacts to the inverted faces similarly in patients and in healthy subjects (for 
whom the inverted face looses its quality as a face), and patients react in a similar way also 
on the non-inverted faces. Only in patients fusiform gyrus displays the same decrease of its 
physiological activity after the repetitive presentation of the irregular face and after the 
repetitive presentation of the regular face. It means that for the patients it is not very 
important whether the face is irregular or not, and they are more ready to perceive the 
irregular transfigured face as a normal one because they are unable to discriminate a normal 
face from an irregular. In patients in comparison to healthy subjects fusiform gyrus is less 
functionally connected with amygdala and prefrontal cortex and it may be related to the 
absence of the normal emotional reaction on the face. In healthy subjects the effect of the 
repetition of the stimulus (habituation) is decreased when the face is irregular and is 
estimated as a strange or unpleasant. 

In healthy subjects the oxygenation of the right fusiform face area is more prominent in 
the process of the retardation (remembering) of faces that are afterward more easy 
recognized, while in schizophrenic patients this difference is absent (Walther et al., 2009). 
While recognizing famous and unfamiliar faces schizophrenic patients display less 
oxygenation in these structures, the performance is worse, the reaction time is longer. The 
evoked potential N170 that in healthy subjects appear on the early stages of the identification 
of human faces, in schizophrenic patients is similar in the process of face and object 
identification (Obayashi et al., 2009). It means that the face is perceived as any other object. In 
healthy subjects when they have to remember a face the FMRI amplitude is higher than when 
they have to remember chairs. In schizophrenic patients this difference is absent (Walther et 
al., 2009). In healthy subjects the amplitude is higher during the correct recognition in 
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comparison to false recognition. In patients such difference is absent. In the process of the 
recognition of famous faces in patients the reaction time is increased, as in the false 
recognition of the unfamiliar faces. Schizophrenic patients are characterized by the decreased 
sensitivity to the low-rate stimulation that is especially important on the early stage of face 
recognition (Obayashi et al., 2009). 

It is necessary to take into consideration that schizophrenic patients have problems in 
integration of the fragments into the holistic image not only during face perception but also 
during perception of the more simple objects (Doniger et al., 2001, 2002).  They need more 
information for the correct identification of objects, and they are more sensitive to the visual 
backward masking of objects. When patients have to reproduce a straight line that contains 
“occasional” gaps they, in contrast to healthy subjects, do not fill in these gaps automatically 
and are reproducing them more correct – their imagination does not fill up these gaps 
(Snyder et al., 1961). 

Despite of the all differences from healthy subjects, the performance of the task in the 
schizophrenic patients is improved as in healthy subjects when before performing face or 
object recognition they get pictures or verbal information that are relevant to the task 
(Doniger et al., 2001). It is possible to suggest that the presentation of these additional 
stimulus helps to create a concept that promotes the perception. However, according to some 
investigations (Tremea et al., 2009) schizophrenic patients often prescribe to these predictive 
signals an irrelevant meaning: signals that objectively are not dangerous are accepted as 
dangerous, while signals that are really signs of danger are not accepted as such. 
Schizophrenic patients often prescribe negative emotions like fear or disgust to the neutral 
face expressions (Kohler et al., 2003). 

A perception closure can explain the inability to build the holistic object by using the 
perceived information and imagination combined with previous experience. Promotions that 
are helping to form a concept of the whole (I emphasize – concept instead of gestalt) may 
partly replace this non-integrated previous experience. Probably the construction of the 
conditional monosemantic concept based on the recognition of single features that are often 
repeated in the process of perception help to recognize faces of famous persons . The often 
repetition of the same visual expressions may explain also the successful recognition of the 
subject’s own face (Pomarol-Clotet et al., 2009). However, schizophrenic patients spend more 
time for the recognition of their own faces than for the identification of familiar faces (Platek 
et al., 2002). It may be explained by the deficiency of the Self-Image. Schizophrenic patients 
often react on their own image in the mirror as if it is somebody else, somebody who exists 
independently (Harrington et al., 1989). They have also problems in recognition their own 
body image (Daprati et al., 1997). At the same time the inanimate objects are perceived 
normally (Orbach et al., 1966). Close relatives of schizophrenic patients also need more time 
than healthy subjects to recognize the self face, however in general they are more able to 
differentiate themselves from others. And patients periodically perceive their image in the 
mirror as a face of somebody else, even of somebody unknown (Platek et al., 2008). 

The difference between healthy subjects and persons with a high level of schizothypy 
display itself also in some motor reactions. When healthy people are reacting on the 
adjectives that  relate to them their left hand reacts more speed than the right one (Platek et 
al., 2003) but in subjects with a high level of schizopthypy this advantage of the left hand is 
absent.  

In the investigation of Irani et al. (2006) schizophrenic patients, their relatives and healthy 
subjects have been asked to estimate as speed as possible whether the presented picture is 
their own face, the face of the unknown (unfamiliar) subject or a face of the familiar subject. 
The recognition of the own face was most successful in a healthy subjects and less successful 
in patients. 

It was also found that only those subjects who are able to recognize themselves in the 
mirror are able to prescribe the mental state to another person in a relevant way. Although 
patients who do not recognize their own face are able to recognize the familiar faces, it is 
difficult for them to recognize unfamiliar faces if they have seen them only once before – 
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more difficult than for healthy subjects. When they were unable to recognize their own faces 
but recognized the familiar faces they often were surprised while looking in the mirror: “Is it 
really I? I supposed that it is somebody whom I know.” (Platek et al., 2004). Thus, it confirms 
the disturbance of Self-Image combined with the preservation of autobiographical memory. 

Face inversion disturbed the perception of the face expression in patients less than in 
healthy subjects (Bleich-Cohen et al., 2009). Schizophrenic patients perceived the distorted 
face as less strange, in comparison to healthy subjects. As I have already proposed, it may be 
a sign that patients even without inversion perceive a face as an object without penetrating in 
its human nature. In such condition it is also impossible to build special human empathic 
interpersonal relationships that help to experience emotions of other person as subject’s own 
emotions. Consequently, emotions can be recognized only by using the initial concept that 
connects definite configurations and features of the face with definite emotions. 

The investigations of the identification of facial emotional expressions in schizophrenic 
patients contain many contradictions. In some investigations was shown that schizophrenic 
patients are more sensitive to positive emotional expressions vs. negative (Kohler et al., 2003; 
Bleich-Cohen, et al., 2009; Silver et al., 2009) . Accuracy in identifying sad faces was lower 
than of happy faces (Silver et al., 2009). Schizophrenic patients exhibited lower scores for 
open-mouth angry expressions (Leppanen et al., 2008). They displayed cognitive avoidance 
of negative stimuli (Morris et al., 2006). Definite fear antecedents were more frequently 
judged by schizophrenic patients as non-emotional, in comparison to healthy subjects 
(Tremea et al., 2009). Walker et al. (1980) have found in schizophrenic patients greater deficit 
in recognition of negative emotions. In opposite to healthy subjects who display a highest 
amplitude of evoked potentials while observing the negative emotional face expressions 
(Caharel et al., 2005; An et al., 2003) schizophrenic patients are more sensitive to the 
expression of happiness than to the expression of sadness. However this difference 
disappears when negative symptoms dominate in the clinical picture, and in any case 
patients are recognizing relatively simple emotions like sadness and joy worse than healthy 
subjects do (Turetsky et al., 2007).  

Other investigators have found that patients in general more often estimate a face as a sad 
one (Tsoi et al., 2008).  According to Turetsky et al., 2007, the amplitude of the N170 response 
to sad faces was in patients inversely associated with the severity of positive symptoms and 
with presence of delusions, and it corresponds to the above mentioned data of the same 
authors that the more prominent reaction on the expression of happiness vs. sadness 
disappears with the domination of negative symptoms. Thus, when Turetsky et al. (2007) 
conclude that happy faces where easier to identify for schizophrenic patients it means that 
their patients were characterized by the more prominent positive symptoms. 

However, there are also opposite findings (Seiferth et al., 2009) that schizophrenic patients 
are characterized by the increased vulnerability to negative emotions, and delusions increase 
sensitivity to fear. It was also shown  that the recognition of sadness is less impaired in 
schizophrenic patients (35) as well as that they display the decreased ability to recognize 
happy faces in contrast to sad and fearful faces (Tsoi et al., 2008). Tsoi et al. (2008) discovered 
in patients tendency to prescribe fear and sadness to any facial expression and to perceive 
neutral expressions as unpleasant, together with the decreased sensitivity to happy faces. 
According to (Seiferth et al., 2009) young schizophrenic patients reacted faster than they 
healthy coevals when identifying sad faces, but they were impaired in specificity when 
discriminating these faces. It means that even faces that were not definitely sad have been 
identified as such. In concordance with this investigation are data (Tremea et al., 2009) that 
by schizophrenic patients non-fear antecedents are more frequently judged as fear 
antecedents, and data of Kohler et al. (2003) that schizophrenic patients attribute disgust and 
fear to neutral faces. 

Another investigation (Green et al., 2003) discovered in schizophrenia an early increased 
sensitivity to and later avoidance of threat related facial expressions like anger and fear. 
Schizophrenic patients perceived angry emotions more rapidly than controls. They are also 
changing more rapidly from the happy emotional pole to the angry pole regardless of the 
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social context and are not able to make relevant social judgments when the context of 
conversation changes slightly. It means that they are less sensitive to the social nuances of 
conversation. According to Huang et al (2008) schizophrenic patients were more alert to 
angry facial expressions in the process of social expressions being morphed from happy to 
angry. 

According to many other investigations, schizophrenic patients have problems in the 
identification of all facial emotional expressions, either positive or negative (Yamada et al., 
2009). In general, the fine differences in face expression recognition are less prominent in 
schizophrenic patients (Seiferth et al., 2009). In comparison to healthy subjects, patients 
poorly recognize more complex facial expressions of emotions (Alfimova et al., 2009). 
Patients performed worse that control subjects on recognition of all emotions and neutral 
faces combined, including mild and extreme emotional expressions (Kohler et al., 2003). 
Patients showed less benefit from increased intensity for all emotions combined, especially 
for fear. Happy faces were often recognized as neutral and even as sad, while sad faces were 
misrecognized as neutral or disgusted. Angry faces were most commonly misrecognized as 
neutral, or disgusted, or fearful. Fearful faces were recognized as neutral, or disgusted, or 
sad. At the same time, patients misidentified neutral cues as emotionally valued with a 
negative bias (Kohler et al., 2003). Thus, patients seem to be confused with any facial 
emotional expressions. According to Tsoi et al. (2008) and Pomarol-Clotet et al. (2009) the 
reaction time on all emotional expressions is increased in patients.      

Turetsky et al. (2007) have found that controls performed better than schizophrenic 
patients in recognizing all facial emotions, and authors come to the conclusion that affect 
recognition deficit for happy and sad expressions discrimination is secondary to faulty 
structural encoding of faces. Kohler et al. (2000) have shown that it is difference between 
genders in facial emotional recognition task performance: male patients perform it relatively 
worse than females. 

Finally, according to some investigations (Pomarol-Clotet et al., 2009 ) schizophrenic 
patients do not show deficit in emotion identification although nevertheless the process of 
identification requires more time (see also Tsoi et al. 2008) and patients are less sensitive to 
the intensity of facial emotional expression (Pomarol-Clotet et al., 2009). According to Seiferth 
et al (2009), a sensitivity to emotions in patients is not lost, however  the task to discriminate  
emotions and  to ignore faces that display emotions that is not necessary to recognize is too 
difficult for patients. 

How is it possible to explain all these contradictory results? From my point of view, there 
may be different explanations. Schizophrenia is a very complicated disorder with many 
“faces” and different states and combinations of symptoms. In different states the 
mechanisms of face expressions recognition may be different. In addition, the comparison 
between the recognition of different emotional expressions inside the group of patients may 
give different results from the comparison of recognition the same emotional expressions 
between patients and healthy subjects. 

Schizophrenic patients may be in general less sensitive to any emotional expressions 
either positive or negative than healthy subjects are. It may be an outcome of emptiness of the 
world of human interrelationships for the patients. If they in most cases perceive a world of 
human relationships as a big gray spot than the difference in perception of different 
emotional expressions of other people is de-evaluated. This explanation corresponds also to 
the decreased sensitivity to the meaning of facial expressions in social context and to the 
decreased sensitivity to the artificial distortion of faces: as it was mentioned, patients often 
accepted these distorted faces as normal. It is understandable if patients are unable to create 
empathic relationships with other people and if they perceive human faces as inanimate 
objects. 

However, such decreased sensitivity to emotional feelings of other people may be in 
patients on different level, and on the other hand it does not exclude the sensitivity (and even 
high sensitivity) not as a sign of empathy but as a sign of the patients’ own vulnerability. It is 
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a difference between feeling of a pain or of happiness of other subject and a feeling of own 
pain.  

When patients display a relatively increased sensitivity to positive vs. negative 
expression, it can be explained by two different mechanisms. It may be an activity of the 
defense mechanism that protects subject from the negative experience he cannot integrate 
(see later) – “don’t touch me”. Or it may be the orientation on the very definite simple facial 
features like smile that helps to form a definite concept – what this form of lips means – 
without any feeling of embodied simulation and empathic relationships. 

The opposite result – the relatively higher sensitivity to the negative vs. positive 
expression – can be explained in the same frame of reasons. Many patients prescribe negative 
expressions like anger, fear and disgust to the objectively neutral faces and at the same time 
they are unable to recognize real negative expressions. It is possible to suggest that due to 
their insensitivity to “humanness” in human relationships they found the world of human 
being (represented by the vivid human face even with the neutral emotional expression) as 
something strange and potentially dangerous. Although patients perceive faces in the same 
way as objects, these strange ‘objects” are still different from other objects and due to their 
vivid nature they cause straining. They evoke fear and anxiety because patients do not feel 
the nature of face expression and accept it as something not understandable (Morris et al., 
2009).  It is difficult for patients to understand the intentions of other people and it can cause 
the suspiciousness. This can be a reason of the prescription of the disgust and anger to the 
neutral faces, or it can be a projection of the patients’ inner state. What patients accept as a 
cause of fear healthy subjects are estimating as neutral expressions (Tremea et al., 2009). (On 
the other hand, it may be difficult for patients to recognize Joyful expression and expression 
of happiness because patients have no self-identifications with these feelings and they are 
able to recognize them only in a conceptual way, as I have already explained).      

Thus, if in patients the ability to react normally on the essence of human face is absent, 
this essence nevertheless produces an emotional tension as something that subject is unable 
to integrate into his/her inner world.  

In order to preserve sensitiveness to the information that causes anxiety and frustration 
and at the same time not to lose the adaptive behavior, person has to integrate this 
information with his world image and Self Image. It is the right frontal lobe that is 
responsible for this integration however exactly this brain structure is functionally inefficient 
in schizophrenic patients (Rotenberg, 2004, 2007). 

The inability to recognize the face and its emotional expression may be an outcome of the 
inability to integrate separate features of the image into the holistic gestalt (Doninger et al., 
2002). In schizophrenic patients men are less sensitive to the facial expressions than women. 
At the same time, healthy women are reacting more on the local features of the complex 
visual stimuli than on their global entities (Roalf et al., 2006). It is possible to suggest that 
men may be more vulnerable to the disturbance of the right hemisphere functions in 
psychiatric diseases exactly because healthy men are in general more “right-hemispheric” 
(see Rotenberg, 2004).  

According to Johnson et al. (2005), the disturbance of the global perceptual grasping is the 
common feature of schizophrenic patients and does not depend on the difference between 
genders.  However, because women are in general more predisposed to the left hemispheric 
style of perception of local features, including faces, they may be less vulnerable to the 
dysfunction of the right hemisphere caused by the disease. Probably the problem of 
schizophrenic patients is not a specific disability to recognize the expression of the face but 
the deficiency of global perception? Kucharska-Pietura et al. (2009) beliefs that the distorted 
recognition of facial emotional expression may be a consequence of the deficient face 
recognition and for this reason patients are also less able to recognize famous subjects. From 
my point of view this approach ignores a very specific essence of human interrelationships 
that is a core of essential face and face expression recognition.   

The feeling of danger while observing the neutral face expression is still not so strong to 
activate the perceptual defense or repression. But it is strong enough to  prescribe to this face 
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negative emotions (like a form of delusions). More definite negative expressions can already 
activate psychological defense. This approach can explain a seeming paradox when 
schizophrenic patients prescribe to the neutral faces negative expressions while are unable to 
recognize obvious negative expressions. 

The less patients are able to accept the world, and especially the world of human 
relationships, in its polysemantic nature, and to integrate their own feelings and experiences, 
the less protected they are.   
 
 
 6. CONCLUSION 
 
The present essay contains the following propositions: 

1. The identification of human faces, and especially previously unfamiliar faces, is not 
based (with the exception of some extraordinary exotic cases) neither on the 
estimation of the particular single features of the face nor on their configurations that 
can be calculated and displayed as a relatively simple frame. Human faces differ 
from any objects and in opposite to objects the inversion of faces disturbs their 
identification. 

2. The recognition of human face depends on the ability of the observer to create 
holistic and polydimensional virtual relationships with the owner of this face ( the 
observed person) and these relationships include the previous experience of the 
observer in the domain of the interpersonal communications. It may explain the 
implicit integrative conclusion often made by observer according to the face of the 
unfamiliar subject with a neutral face expression – whether the owner of this face is 
pleasant or unpleasant and even dangerous. This ability to create immediately 
complicated polysemantic relationships is a function of the right hemisphere. 

3. The similar mechanism is responsible for the recognition of different facial emotional 
expressions, especially of complicated and vague expressions that need emotional 
contact (at least virtual and one-side directed) of observer with the observed person, 
in order to be understood correctly. For instance, in order to feel that the smile is 
false or represents not a feeling of joy but a feeling of superiority it is necessary to get 
the holistic impression about the observed subject. However, in more simple cases of 
the conventional and standard facial expressions (that are often used in the process 
of investigations) facial expressions may be recognized on the basis of local features 
of the face without interpersonal contact (when smiling lips are estimated as a sign of 
joy and frown brow as a sign of anger).  It is a conceptualization of the facial 
expression, and when the real emotional state beyond such expressions is more 
complicated this conceptualization may cause mistakes in interpretation. It is worth 
to stress that such conceptualization can be used in the process of estimation of the 
relatively simple facial expressions but not in the process of recognition of the 
unfamiliar faces. 

4. Another reason of the difficulties and mistakes in recognition of emotional 
expressions (negative) may be a psychological defense of highly sensitive persons or 
of persons who are in close relationships with the observed subject. 

5. The recognition of famous faces may be based on the conceptualized socially 
determined associations, that are monosemantic and different from the mechanism 
of polydimensional interpersonal relationships that are used in the process of the 
perception of the unfamiliar faces that have to be further recognized. 

6. The process of the recognition of subject’s own face is based predominantly on the 
right-hemispheric Self Image and partly on the left hemispheric Self Concept. If the 
Self-Concept dominates in this process the own face may be mixed with the familiar 
face (how it happens in patients with suppressed right hemisphere and in 
schizophrenia). 
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7. For schizophrenic patients due to the right hemisphere insufficiency human face is 
losing its unique human essence and quality and is accepted as an object. 
Schizophrenic patients do not create the virtual polydimensional relationships with 
the observed subject in order to integrate this subject in their own polysemantic 
world like it happens in healthy subjects. However, human face is for the patient a 
strange object that is alien and not understandable, and just because of such 
perception of the face human faces even with neutral expression can cause emotional 
tension in schizophrenia. Probably due to this mechanism schizophrenic patients are 
ready to prescribe to the neutral observed faces negative expressions like anger, fear 
or disgust. At the same time, paradoxically, the same negative emotions being really 
expressed are often not recognized by the patients. My suggestion is that when they 
are really expressed they are crossing the “red line” for acceptance. And positive 
emotions are often not recognized by these patients due to the lack of identification 
with positive feelings. 
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